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DECISION 

Dispute Codes MNDL-S, MNDCL-S, FFL       

Introduction 

This hearing was convened as a result of the landlords’ Application for Dispute 
Resolution (“application”) seeking remedy under the Residential Tenancy Act (“Act”) for 
a monetary order for damages to the unit, site or property, to retain the tenant’s security 
deposit, for money owed for compensation for damage or loss under the Act, regulation 
or tenancy agreement, and to recover the cost of the filing fee.  

An agent for the landlord KM (“agent”) attended the teleconference hearing and gave 
affirmed testimony. During the hearing the agent was given the opportunity to provide 
their evidence orally. A summary of the evidence is provided below and includes only 
that which is relevant to the hearing.   

As the tenant did not attend the hearing, service of the Notice of a Dispute Resolution 
Proceeding (“Notice of Hearing”), application and documentary evidence were 
considered. The agent testified that the Notice of Hearing and application were served 
on the tenant by registered mail with signature required on January 7, 2019, and that 
the mail was addressed to the tenant at the forwarding address provided by the tenant 
on the outgoing Condition Inspection Report (“CIR”). The registered mail tracking 
number has been included on the cover page of this decision for ease of reference.  
According to the online registered mail tracking website the registered mail package 
was signed for and accepted by the tenant on January 11, 2019. As a result, I find the 
tenant was served with the Notice of Hearing, application and documentary evidence on 
January 11, 2019, which is the date the tenant signed for and accepted the registered 
mail package. Therefore, the hearing continued without the tenant present and as such, 
I consider this application to be unopposed by the tenant.  
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Regarding item 1, the landlords have claimed $94.50, as the tenant failed to pay the 
landlords for the tenant’s request to add a basketball cable package on at the tenant’s 
expense. The agent referred to an email submitted in evidence in which the tenant 
confirms that they are requesting the landlords to have the basketball package added 
and that the tenant will pay for the cost.  
 
Regarding item 2, the landlords have claimed $250.00 for the cost to re-stretch the 
carpet. The agent referred to a receipt in the amount of $250.00 and several colour 
photos in support that the rental unit carpets were in need of re-stretching after the 
tenant vacated the rental unit. The agent referred to the incoming and outgoing CIR to 
support that the carpets were in good condition at the start of the tenancy and required 
re-stretching after the tenant vacated the rental unit.  
 
Regarding item 3, the landlords have claimed $367.50 for the cost to clean the rental 
unit carpets, which the agent stated were not cleaned before the tenant vacated the 
rental unit. The agent also referred to a receipt in the amount claimed for carpet 
cleaning in support of this portion of the landlords’ claim. The agent also referred to 
colour photos, which the agent stated show a dirty carpet in need of cleaning.  
 
Regarding item 4, the landlords have claimed $204.75 to clean the rental unit, which is 
supported by a receipt in the same amount. The agent referred to several colour photos, 
which the agent stated show a rental unit that was not cleaned by the tenant before the 
tenant vacated the rental unit and was left in a dirty condition.  
 
Regarding items 5 and 7, the agent withdrew these items during the hearing as the 
agent confirmed that there was no inventory for the furnished rental unit and as a result, 
items 5 and 7 will not be considered further in this decision. 
 
Regarding item 6, the landlords have claimed $472.50 for the cost to do touch-up 
painting in the rental unit. The agent stated that the rental unit paint was three years old. 
The agent referred to the receipt submitted in the amount of $472.50 and many colour 
photos to show the areas that were touched up as a result of what the agent described 
was damage by blinds from leaving windows open, which caused the blinds to swing 
and damage the walls.  
 
Regarding item 8, the landlords have claimed $400.00 to repair damage blinds in the 
rental unit. The agent presented a receipt for $400.00 and referred to the incoming and 
outgoing CIR in support that the blinds were in good condition at the start of the tenancy 
and damaged at the end of the tenancy.  








