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$375.00 at the start of the tenancy, which the landlord held in trust.  The tenant vacated 
the rental unit on June 30, 2019.       

The tenant was assisted by the legal advocate JB. The tenant advised that the “Notice” 
was served on the landlord on September 26, 2019, requesting the return of his security 
deposit for the sum of $350.00. The tenant testified that the landlord had forwarded a 
cheque for the sum of $3160.00 which he received on January 19, 2020. 

The Property Manager testified that the actual amount of the security deposit held in 
Trust was $375.00 The cheque forwarded to the tenant was payment for double the 
security deposit, one month’s rent and compensation. The tenant’s legal advocate 
advised and provided a breakdown to the tenant. The tenant advised that he was 
satisfied with the amount forwarded by the landlord. All parties were in agreement to 
settle the dispute. 

Analysis 

Pursuant to section 63 of the Act, the Arbitrator may assist the parties to settle their 
dispute and if the parties settle their dispute during the dispute resolution proceedings, 
the settlement may be recorded in the form of a decision or an order.  During the 
hearing the parties discussed the issues between them, engaged in a conversation, 
turned their minds to compromise and achieved a resolution of their dispute. 

Both parties agreed to the following final and binding settlement of the tenants’ 
application: 

1. Tenant RRT agreed that he received a cheque for the sum of $3160.00 from the
landlord on January 19, 2020 representing doubling of the security deposit and
compensation as full and final settlement. The parties agree there are no further
claims in relation to this tenancy.

These particulars comprise the full and final settlement of all aspects of this dispute for 
the parties.  The parties gave verbal affirmation at the hearing that they understood and 
agreed to the above terms as legal, final and binding, which settle all aspects of the 
dispute between the parties. 

Conclusion 

This decision is made on authority delegated to me by the Director of the Residential 
Tenancy Branch under Section 9.1(1) of the Residential Tenancy Act. 
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Dated: January 24, 2020 




