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UPreliminary and Procedural Matters 

The agent was informed at the start of the hearing that recording of the dispute 
resolution is prohibited under the RTB Rule 6.11. The agent was also informed that if 
any recording devices were being used, they were directed to immediately cease the 
recording of the hearing. In addition, the agent was informed that if any recording was 
surreptitiously made and used for any purpose, they will be referred to the RTB 
Compliance Enforcement Unit for the purpose of an investigation under the Act. The 
agent did not have had any questions about my direction pursuant to RTB Rule 6.11.  

Furthermore, the agent confirmed their email address at the outset of the hearing and 
stated that they understood that the decision and any applicable orders would be 
emailed to them. The agent also confirmed an email address for the tenant and was 
advised that the decision will be sent by email to the tenant.  

UIssues to be Decided 

• Is the landlord entitled to an order of possession under the Act?
• Is the landlord entitled to a monetary order for unpaid rent or loss of rent under

the Act, and if so, in what amount?
• What should happen to the tenant’s security deposit under the Act?
• Is the landlord entitled to the recovery of the cost of the filing fee under the Act?

UBackground and Evidence 

A copy of the tenancy agreement was submitted in evidence. A fixed-term tenancy 
began on September 1, 2020 and reverted to a month-to-month tenancy after August 
31, 2021. Monthly rent in the amount $1,740.00 is due on first day of each month. The 
tenant paid a security deposit of $870.00, which the landlord continues to hold. The 
agent confirmed that the tenant continues to occupy the rental unit.   

The agent testified that the 10 Day Notice was served by mail on the tenant at the rental 
unit on September 7, 2021. The 10 Day Notice indicates that $1,740.00 was owed in 
rent as of September 1, 2021. The landlord stated that the tenant continues to occupy 
the rental unit and owes a total of $3,470.00 as of the date of the hearing. The agent 
testified that the tenant did not dispute the 10 Day Notice or pay the rent owing. The 
effective vacancy date listed on the 10 Day Notice was September 22, 2021, which has 
passed.   
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The landlord is seeking an order of possession, a monetary order for unpaid rent, and to 
recover the cost of the filing fee.  

UAnalysis 

Based on the undisputed documentary evidence and undisputed testimony provided by 
the agent during the hearing, and on the balance of probabilities, I find the following.   

Order of possession – I accept the agent’s undisputed testimony and I find that the 
tenant failed to pay any of the amount claimed by the landlord as owing or dispute the 
10 Day Notice within 5 days after receiving the 10 Day Notice. Pursuant to section 90 of 
the Act, I find the tenant was deemed served with the 10 Day Notice 5 days after it was 
mailed, which would be September 12, 2021. The effective vacancy date of the Notice 
is listed as September 22, 2021, which has passed. I find the tenant is conclusively 
presumed pursuant to section 46 of the Act, to have accepted that the tenancy ended 
on the effective vacancy date of the 10 Day Notice, which was September 12, 2021. 
The tenant continues to occupy the rental unit. Therefore, I grant the landlord an order 
of possession effective two (2) days after service on the tenant.  

I find the tenancy ended on September 22, 2021 and that the tenant has overheld the 
rental unit since that date.  

Claim for unpaid rent and loss of rent – Firstly, as the tenant was served and did not 
attend the hearing, I find the application of the landlord to be unopposed by the tenant. I 
accept the undisputed testimony of the agent that the tenant owes rent as claimed in the 
amount of $3,470.00 and as noted above.  

Pursuant to section 26 of the Act, a tenant must pay rent when it is due in accordance 
with the tenancy agreement. Based on the above, I find that the tenant has breached 
section 26 of the Act by failing to comply with a standard term of the tenancy 
agreement, which stipulates that rent is due monthly on the first day of each month. I 
find the landlord has met the burden of proof and has established a monetary claim of 
$3,470.00 as indicated above.  

As the landlord has succeeded with their application, I grant the landlord the recovery of 
the cost of the filing fee in the amount of $100.00, pursuant to section 72 of the Act.  

I authorize the landlord to retain the tenant’s full security deposit of $870.00, which has 
accrued $0.00 in interest under the Act in partial satisfaction of the landlord’s monetary 
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claim. I grant the landlord a monetary order pursuant to section 67 of the Act, for the 
balance owing by the tenant to the landlord in the amount of $2,700.00.  

I caution the tenant not to breach section 26 of the Act in the future. 

UConclusion 

The landlord’s application is fully successful. The landlord has been granted an order of 
possession effective two (2) days after service upon the tenant. This order must be 
served on the tenant and may be enforced in the Supreme Court of British Columbia. 
The tenancy ended on September 22, 2021.   

The landlord has established a total monetary claim of $3,570.00 and has been granted 
authorization to retain the tenant’s full security deposit of $870.00 to offset the money 
owed. The landlord has been granted a monetary order for the balance owing by the 
tenant to the landlord in the amount of $2,700.00. This order must be served on the 
tenant and may be filed in the Provincial Court (Small Claims) and enforced as an order 
of that court. I caution the tenant that they can be held liable for all costs related to the 
enforcement of both orders. The decision and orders will be emailed to the landlord for 
service on the tenant. The tenant will be sent the decision only via email. The tenant 
has been cautioned as noted above.   

This decision is final and binding on the parties, unless otherwise provided under the 
Act, and is made on authority delegated to me by the Director of the Residential 
Tenancy Branch under Section 9.1(1) of the Residential Tenancy Act. 

Dated: December 6, 2021 




